
 

2022 Stewardship Pledge Card 

To support the work of the First 
Presbyterian Church in Perrysburg, 
OH, I pledge the following total 
amount for the calendar year 

 2022 _____________________________ 

____ Weekly _____ Monthly ____Annually 

Name ______________________________ 

Address ________________________ 

    ____________________________ 

Phone _____________________________ 

Email ______________________________ 

Please turn into the church office 
during office hours or mail to: 

 First Presbyterian Church 
 200 East Second Street 
 Perrysburg, OH  43551 
 

Office Hours: 
Tuesday – Friday 
9 AM – 1 PM 

 
Join us as we proclaim the 
     Gospel of Jesus Christ 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

What you should know about your 
pledge of support …… 

1. It is confidential.  All gifts and pledges 
to First Presbyterian Church are 
confidential. 

2. It is urgent.  The major source of 
support for our Church is the  
generosity of the individuals who 
worship here. 

3. It is an act of faith. Offering the first 
portion of your blessings to God is an 
expression of thanks and praise.  All 
Christians are commanded to “honor 
the Lord with the first fruits of your 
produce” (Proverbs 3:9). 

4. It is a joyful expression of your 
commitment to First Presbyterian 
Church.  We ask you to be prayerfully 
discerning about what God is calling 
you to give to the ministry of this faith 
community. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Worship, Service, 
Connection, Learning 


